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St Luke’s is built on a core set of Christian values, where children feel happy and cared for. 
Here they find, love, joy, hope and peace. 

 
John 13: 34-35 says: ‘Love one another. As I have loved you… By this everyone will know that you 

are my disciples.’ 
 

‘Following in God’s way, Learning day by day, Working with one another, Caring for each other’ 
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Introduction 
 
1.1 At St Luke’s we believe that effective assessment provides information to improve teaching and 

learning. We give our children regular feedback on their learning so that they understand what it is 
that they need to do better. This allows us to base our lesson plans on a detailed knowledge of each 
pupil. We give parents regular reports on their child’s progress so that teachers, children and 
parents are all working together to raise standards for all our children. 

 
Aims and objectives 
 
2.1 The aims and objectives of assessment in our school are: 

• to enable our children to demonstrate what they know, understand and can do in their work; 

• to help our children understand what they need to do next to improve their work; 

• to allow teachers to plan work that accurately reflects the needs of each child; 

• to provide regular information for parents that enables them to support their child’s learning; 

• to provide the headteacher and governors with information that allows them to make judgements 
about the effectiveness of the school. 

 

Planning for assessment 
 
3.1 We use our school’s curriculum plan to guide our teaching. In this plan we set out the aims, 

objectives and values of our school and give details of what is to be taught to each year group. In 
our school curriculum plan we also identify opportunities for assessment within each broad unit of 
work.  

 
3.2 We use the National Curriculum to support our teaching and assessment. We use the assessment 

guidance from Learning Ladders, Interim Writing Assessment documents, termly tests, SAT papers 
and PM Benchmark (reading) to help us identify each child’s level of attainment. 

 
 
3.3 We plan our lessons with clear learning objectives which are based upon the teacher’s detailed 

subject knowledge and the expectations for each child (Can I…? questions). We strive to ensure 
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that all tasks set are appropriate to each child’s level of ability and lesson plans make clear the 
expected outcomes for each lesson.  We regularly share with the children and ask them to help 
construct ‘steps to success’ or ‘success criteria’, this enables the children to know how to progress 
independently. 

 

Target setting 
 
4.1 Pupils are set targets across the curriculum using the National Curriculum age related expectations 

for their year group. In Reading, Writing and Maths we use the Learning Ladder statements which 
are linked to these expectations. We set Learning Ladder point score targets at the start of each 
year; these enable us to measure progress, set realistic but challenging targets for all groups of 
children. In order to achieve these targets, we adapt the teaching and learning appropriately within 
the classroom. We review the progress of each child at the end of each half term.   

 
 

Recording 
 
5.1 We recognise various methods of assessing a child’s learning. We record information that affects 

future learning. English and Maths assessments are recorded in the teachers assessment/record 
book. Foundation subjects are assessed at the end of each term using a whole school tracking 
system. The children’s knowledge and understanding for that term are assessed against the 
expectations from the National Curriculum.  

 
5.2 We plan lessons with clear learning objectives, following the expectations as set out in our medium 

term plans. In the wider curriculum, the medium term plans provide examples of assessment 
opportunities and we use them to document the names of those pupils who fail to meet the learning 
objective or who achieve more than was planned, so that we can take the needs of these pupils into 
account when planning for the next lesson and inform subject leaders and subsequent teachers. 
Where the majority of the class makes the planned progress, there is no need to record this. In 
English and Maths we use annotated daily lesson plans, as appropriate, as a record of progress 
measured against learning objectives.  

 
5.3 Lesson objectives are presented to the children in child friendly language, but still reflect the 

demands of the National Curriculum. Our teachers record the progress of each child against these 
objectives. This enables them to make a judgement about the work of each child in relation to the 
National Curriculum level of attainment. This allows us to monitor the progress of each child. Each 
teacher passes this information on to the subsequent teacher at the end of each year.  

 
 

Reporting to parents 
 
6.1 We have a range of strategies that keep parents fully informed of their child’s progress in school. We 

encourage parents to contact the school to discuss with their child’s class teacher if they have 
concerns about any aspect of their child’s work.  

 
 
6.2 Twice yearly, we offer parents the opportunity to meet their child’s teacher, and at both parent’s 

evenings, targets that we have identified for their child are discussed with them. At the second 
meeting of the year (which we hold during the spring term) we evaluate their child’s progress and 
give feedback to the parents.  

 
6.3 During the summer term, we give all parents a written report of their child’s progress and 

achievements during the year.  We write individual comments on areas within English and Maths 
and on Religious Education and Collective Worship. In this written report we also comment on the 
child’s personal qualities and behaviour and include a space for parental feedback.  

 
6.4 In reports for pupils in Year 2 and Year 6 we also provide details of those who have achieved or 

exceeded age related expectations. In Year 1 we report on those who have passed the Phonics 
Screening Test and in Year 4, we share individual Multiltiplication Times Table Check Scores with 
parents.  



 
6.5 We offer parents of pupils in Reception Year the opportunity to discuss the Early Years Foundation 

Stage Profile with their child’s teacher. Parents are updated on their child’s progress during the year 
and receive a print out showing achievement in all areas with their written report. 

 
6.6 The teachers publish, on their class website page, a curriculum overview that identifies the main 

areas of study for that particular class. This enables the parents to know in advance what their child 
will be learning during the term so that they can then offer their child support. 

 

Feedback to pupils 
 
7.1 We believe that feedback to pupils is very important, as it tells them how well they have done and 

what they need to do next in order to improve their work. We have an agreed code for marking 
within English and Maths, as this ensures that all staff within the same Key Stage mark in the same 
way. 

 
7.2 We give children verbal feedback on their work whenever possible. We usually do this when the 

children are working during the lesson although we sometimes give feedback on a particular lesson 
at the beginning of the next one. When lesson time does not allow for verbal feedback, we write 
comments on the children’s work during marking, relating to the objectives set for the lesson and 
indicating where improvement can be made.  

 
7.3 When we give written feedback to a child, whenever possible we relate this to the learning objective 

for the lesson. By so doing, we make clear whether the objective has been met and we produce 
evidence to support the judgement. If we consider that the objective has not been met, we make 
clear why this was the case. In both cases we identify what the child needs to do next in order to 
improve future work. 

 
 

Monitoring and Review 
 
8.1 All subject leaders use examples of children’s work to make judgements about the standards gained 

within their subject area. All teachers meet to moderate attainment and progress so that they have a 
common understanding of the expectations in each subject. By doing this we ensure that we make 
consistent judgements about standards in the school. 

 
8.2 Subject Leaders regularly monitor and review the teaching and learning in their subject area by 

carrying out quality assurances which may involve: 

• Lesson observations 

• Book scrutiny 

• Discussions with staff 

• Discussions with children 

• Data scrutiny 
As a result of these quality assurances, Subject Leaders make judgements of the effectiveness of 
the learning in their subject, producing Action Plans and Subject Evaluation Summaries to help them 
to make appropriate alterations to the planning in order to improve standards. These changes may 
also be made as a result of new initiatives, changes to the curriculum, CPD or evidence-based 
research.  

 
 
 
 
 

 

                                                                                                                


